UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION FOR BID 2015-105 TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPPLIES, MATERIALS, AND EQUIPMENT
BIDDERS/OFFERORS: PLEASE TYPE IN THE BID PRICE IN BID AMOUNT
COLUMN. IF NO BID PLEASE TYPE "NO BID" IN THE BID AMOUNT COLUMN.
WHEN COMPLETE, PRINT AND SUBMIT WITH BID.
ANNUAL Custom Products Lightle Enterprises Osburn Pathmark Traffic Safelane Traffic
ITEM LENGTH DIAMETER ESTIMATE Buyers Barricades Centerline Supply Corporation of Ohio Associates, Inc. Products of Texas, Inc. Supply LLC Vulcan Signs
ITEM BidAmount | BidTotal | BidAmount | BidTotal | Bid Amount | BidTotal | Bid Amount BidTotal | Bid Amount Bid Total Bid Amount Bid Total Bid Amount Bid Total Bid Amount | Bid Total
NUMBER |ALUMINUM SHEETING
1 |OCTAGONAL Ri-1 ALUMINUM BLANK PREDRILLED 30" 30" 200 NoBid _|S s 1450 [$ 290000 |5 1401 | $ 2,802.00 No Bid 5 - |s 1298|s 2506008 1299 [$ 259800 | 19555 3901000 |$ 1120 |$ 224000
TRI ANGLE R1-2 ALUMINUM BLANK PREDRILLED 36" % 36" x 36" 100 NoBid _|$ 830 [ 830005 1178 |$ 1,178.00 No Bid $ - s oss[s 936.00 | 979 5 979.00 | 5 18005 180000 S  861|$ 86100
3 |SQUARE/DIAMOND ALUMINUM BLANK PREDRILLED 24" x 24" 50 NoBid [s 1150 57500 |s 981 (s 49050 No Bid ~ s sa2s 41600 | § 899 44950 | $ 1250 [ 5 625,00 7.98 399.00
4 |SQUARE/DIAMOND ALUMINUM BLANK PREDRILLED 30°x30" 200 NoBid _[S 17,50 350000 5 1524 | $ 3048.00 No Bid ~ |5  1o03]s 25000[8 1399 279800 5 1955 [s 391000 1252 2,504.00
5 |SQUARE/DIAMOND ALUMINUM BLANK PREDRILLED 36 x 36" 100 NoBid _[s 29.75 297500 | 5 3531 | § 353100 No Bid — s 2s67|s 2367008 10.99 1,999.00 | & 3375 [s 337500 2264 2.264.00
6 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 12°x6" 10 NoBid _[$ 180 18005 1465 1460 No Bid ~ s 105[s 1050 [ 200 2000 s 250 s 25.00 127 1270
7 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 187X 6" 10 NoBid _[S 216 2160[s 219[s 2190 No Bid ~ s 1%6(s 1560 | 280 2800 | $ 350 [ 35,00 171 17.10
8 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 20°x6" 10 NoBid _[s 3.70 3700 [s 2425 2420 No Bid ~ s 173s 17.30 [ 400 4000 | $ 395 s 3950 186 1860
9 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 30°x6" 10 NoBid _[$ 435 4350 |s 3565 3560 No Bid — s 2e0]s 2600 | 400 4000 | $ 425 s 4250 2.70 27.00
10 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 24X 10" 10 NoBid _[S 265 4650 |s 427 (s 4270 No Bid ~ s sar[s 3470 [ 450 4500 | $ 550 [ 55.00 350 35.00
11 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 187X 12" 10 NoBid _[S 3.98 2080[s 384[s 3840 No Bid - s  a12[s 3120 [§ 369 3690 | s 500 | s 50.00 303 3030
12 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 36 x 12" 200 NoBid _[s 7.97 150400 |5 7.38 |5 147600 No Bid ~ s 62a]s 12800(s 6.99 139800 | § 950 s 1,90000 621 1,242.00
13 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 18X 16" 100 NoBid _[$ 17,50 175000 | S 566 |5 56600 No Bid ~ s aess 468.00 | & 529 52900 | $ 710(s 710.00 466 466,00
14 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 24X 18" 200 NoBid _[S 805 161000 7.38 |5 147600 No Bid ~ s 62a]s 12800(s 6.99 1,398.00 | $ 950 s 1,90000 6.03 1,206.00
15 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 30X 16" 10 NoBid _[S 9.37 9370|s  903[s 9030 No Bid - s 780s 78.00 | $ 9.00 9000 s 1190 8 119.00 7.69 76.90
16 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 36X 16" 10 NoBid _[$ 12.46 12460 [s 1078 |s 107.80 No Bid - s o3]s 9360 | § 11.00 11000 | s 1400 s 140.00 9.20 92.00
17 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 30 24" 200 NoBid _[$ 1371 274200 | 5 12.10 | § 2.438.00 No Bid — [ 1040]s 2080008 1099 219800 [ 5 15758 3150.00 993 1,986.00
18 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 48" x 24" 100 NoBid _[S 27.11 271100 |5 31.39 | § 3,130.00 No Bid ~ |5 o104]s 210000(8 17.99 1,799.00 | s 3000 s 3,000.00 2000 2,000.00
19 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 48" 30" 10 NoBid _[s 3082 30820 [s 39145 39140 No Bid — s 2a30]s 26300 | § 24.90 24900 | § 3750 | $ 375.00 24.96 249.60
20 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 96" x 36" 10 NoBid _[$ 95.33 95330 |5 12207 [ $ 122070 No Bid - s s s 775.20 | 85.00 850.00 | & 10500 5 1,050.00 74.44 744,40
21 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 36" x 45" 10 NoBid _[S 27.18 27180 |5 5660 [ 566.00 No Bid ~ s 2059s 29590 | § 30.00 30000 | 5 5000 | § 500.00 28.30 283.00
22 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 2% 9" 600 NoBid _[S 650 390000 [5 649 |5 3894.00 No Bid ~ [s  sa5]s 3027000(8 599 359400 5 1400 s 8.400.00 546 3,276.00
23 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 36'x 9" 600 NoBid _[$ 5.40 324000 5 556 | $ 3336.00 No Bid ~ s ae8|s 280800(8 529 317400 5 1200 [s 720000 473 2,838.00
24 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 30°x9" 600 NoBid _[$ 483 289800 5 467 | S 2802.00 No Bid ~ s s90]s 2310008 449 269400 [ 5 1000 S 600000 394 2,364.00
25 |RECTANGLE ALUMINUM BLANK 24X 9" 600 NoBid _[S 386 231600 [5 374 | S 224400 No Bid - s a12]s 18m00]s 369 221400 |5 800 s 480000 317 1,902.00
26 |ALUMINUM SIGN BLANK 080 GA, FOR CUSTOM SIZE AND PUNCH* Priced by the square foot 1500 NoBid _[S 383 574500 |5 244 | S 3660.00 No Bid ~ [s  oo08|s 3120008 2.39 358500 [ 5 500 s 750000 207 310500
+This 1s for custom signage that Comal County may potentially Purchase. Ths s priced by the square foot E 5
FABRICATED SIGNAGE | - -
27 |OBJECT MARKER OM2-2V PREDRILLED 2 HOLE 400] NoBid_[$ s 530 8 2120005 280 | § 112000 No Bid 5 - s o7s[s 1i00]s 389 155600 | $ 450 [$ 180000 S 246 984.00
28 |FOLDING 3-HING "BOAT RAMP CLOSED" 36'x 36" 10] NoBid _[S — |$  12750[$ 127500]s 9520 s 95200 No Bid $ ~ s wass 47250 | & 59,00 50000 | $ 9500 [ 95000 [8 7367 736.70
29 |WHITE METAL BACK DELINEATOR HIP e xa 1000 NoBid _[S — s 2258 2250005 099 |$ 09000 No Bid $ - No Bid B 139 139000 | $ 175]s  175000|$ 110 1,100.00
POSTS AND HARDWARE
30 |GALVANIZED POZLLOC ANCHOR 27" 2-7/8"0D 2000 NoBid _[s - 976 | 1952000 NoBid |s - No Bid $ - NoBid | - s 7.2 14.580.00 | s 945 s 1890000 1253 |6 25060.00
31 |GALVANIZED WEDGES WITH 9/16" LATCH HOLE 812" 2000 NoBid _[s - 218 436000 | NoBid |s - No Bid $ - NoBid |s - s 279 558000 | 289 [s 578000 324 6.480.00
32 |GALVANIZED SIGN POSTS 12 2:3/8"0D 2000 NoBid _[S - 1882 [ 6 3764000 NoBid [s - No Bid - NoBid |s - s 1499 29.980.00 | $ 1725 [s 3450000 1884 37.680.00
33| DIE CAST ALUMINUM FLAT POST CAP FOR NAME PLATE 5-1/4" BLADE Cap ID 2.3/8" 50 NoBid _[S - 208 20400 Nogid [s - |s 330 16500 (s  325]s 16250 | § 299 14950 | s 310 s 155.00 335 167,50
34| DIE CAST ALUMINUM FLAT POST CAP FOR NAME PLATE 12 BLADE Cap 1D 2.3/8" 1000 NoBid _[S - 9.91 991000 NoBd |s - [s 9256 9250006  575(s 575000 § 7.39 7.390.00 | s 850 [$ 850000 875 8,750.00
35 | DIE CAST ALUMINUM CROSS CAPS 51/4" BLADE Cap 1D 2.3/8" 20 NoBid _[s - 3.97 7940 NoBid [s - s 330 66005 275]s 55.00 | § 299 5080 s 310 s 62.00 335 67.00
36| DIE CAST ALUMINUM CROSS CAPS 12" BLADE Cap 1D 2.3/8" 1000 NoBid _[S - 9.91 991000 NoBd |s - |s 9256 9250006  775(s 775000 |§ 7.39 7.390.00 | s 850 [$ 850000 875 8,750.00
37 |ALUMINUM EXTRUDED SIGN BRACKET 4 BLADE Fits 2-3/8" OD pos| 3000 NoBid _[S - 321 963000 NoBd |s - [s 1676 5010006  425[s 1275000 [§ 119 357000 |5 124]s 372000 335 10,050.00
38 |GALVANIZED SQUARE SIGN POSTS 10 134" 1-3/4" 10 NoBid _[S - 18.63 18630 | NoBid |s - No Bid $ - NoBid |s - s 16.49 16490 | s 1800 | § 180,00 2011 20110
39 |GALVANIZED U-CHANNEL POSTS 6 with full length drilled holes 1000 NoBid _[S - 7.76 776000 | NoBid |s - No Bid $ - NoBid |s - s 6.89 689000 |5 775 s 7.75000 633 6330.00
40 __|WHITE DELINEATOR WINGED GUARDRAIL HIP 100 NoBid _[S - 293 20300 NoBid [s - |s 365 36500 | NoBid [s - s 300 30000 [ s 250 s 250,00 | NoBid: -
41 |WHITE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC WHITE SURFACE MOUNT FLAT TOP 36" 10 NoBid _[S - 32.50 32500 Nogid [s - No Bid - NoBid |s - s 15.00 15000 | s 2000 [ 200,00 | NoBid: -
42 |OCLS WEDGE PULLER TIPS: FITS 9/16" LATCH HOLE 5 NoBid _[S - 3055 15275 | NoBid |s - No Bid - NoBid |s - s 26.00 130,00 No Bid 11680 584.00
23 |OCLS MANUAL SOCKET DRIVE CAP: FITS 2-3/8” OD - 2-1/2" ID 4 NoBid _[S - 272.00 108800 | NoBid [s - No Bid - NoBid |s - s 150,00 60000 | $ 20000 | § 800.00 168.41 673.64
24 |ADJUSTABLE CROSS BRACKET 360° FLAT 5 172" 2:3/8"0D 2 NoBid _[s - 875 21875 | NoBid [s - No Bid - Is  ens[s 168.75 | § 1000 25000 | s 900 s 225,00 1016 254.00
45 [U-BOLT SIGN CLAMP DOUBLE SIDED 238" 50 NoBid [s - 7.66 38300 Nogid [s - No Bid - NoBid | - s 400 20000 | s 600 [ s 300.00 595 297,50
46 |SINGLE MOUNT SQUARE STEEL SIGN SUPPORT W TH BASE, FEET, AND HARDWARE 20 NoBid_|$ - 85.00 170000 | NoBid [s - No Bid - NoBid | - s 10000 200000 |5 7000 [$ 140000 | NoBid
47 __|3/8" WHITE COROPLAST ax8 10 NoBid [s - 7353 73530 | NoBd |s - No Bid - NoBid | - s 35.20 35200 | s 3200 [$ 32000 [$ 41066 41060
ROLL UP SIGNS
28 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "STRIPING AHEAD" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 $ 84500 9125 91250 NoBid |5 - |s 4500 45000 |$ 14578 |s 1457808 86.00 86000 | $ 89.00 | § 89000 | NoBid -
29 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "ROUGH ROAD" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 |$ 84500 9125 91250 | NoBid |5 - |s 4500 45000 |$ 10578 |s 105780 | 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
50 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "LOOSE GRAVEL" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 % 84500 9125 91250 | NoBid |5 - |s 4500 45000 |$ 10578 s 105780 | 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
51 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "BE PREPARED TO STOP" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 % 84500 9125 91250 | NoBid |5 - |s 4500 45000 |$ 10578 |s 105780 | 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
52 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "FLAGGER AHEAD (SYMBOL)" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 % 84500 9125 91250 | NoBid |5 - |s 4500 45000 |$ 10578 s 105780 | 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
53 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "ROAD WORK AHEAD" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 % 84500 9125 91250 | NoBid |5 - |s 4500 45000 |$ 10578 s 105780 | 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
54 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "MOWERS AHEAD" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 % 84500 9125 91250 | NoBid |5 - |s 4500 45000 |$ 10578 s 105780 | 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
55 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "FRESH OIL" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 % 84500 9125 91250 | NoBid |5 - |s 4500 45000 |$ 10578 |s 105780 | 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
56 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "GUARD RAIL DAVAGE AHEAD" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 % 84500 9125 91250 | NoBid |5 - |s 4500 45000 |$ 10578 s 105780 | 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
57 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "ONE LANE ROAD" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 % 84500 9125 91250 | NoBid |5 - |s 4500 45000 |$ 10578 s 105780 | 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
58 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "SHOULDER WORK" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 $ 84500 9125 91250 NoBid |5 - |s 4500 45000 |$ 10578 |s 105780 | 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
50 |ROLL UP REPAIR KIT 10 NoBid [s - 2125 21250 | NoBid [s - No Bid $ - |s ws78|s 1451808 14.00 14000 | s 1000 [ § 10000 | NoBid -
60 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "STRIPING AHEAD" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 |$ 84500 9125 91250 | NoBid [s - |s 4500 |$ 45000 | 14578 |s 1457808 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
61 |REFLECTIVE UP VINYL MESH "NO CENTER STRIPE" 48" 48" 10 $ 8450 $ 84500 9125 91250 NoBid [s - |s 4500 |$ 45000 | 14578 |s 1457808 86.00 86000 | $ 8900 | § 89000 | NoBid -
[TRAFFIC CONTROL / BARRICADES E
62 |ORANGE WARNING FLAG 24" x 24" 10 4995 49008 3616 3610 nNoBd |s - |s 3756 3750 nNoBd [s - s 300 3000 s 200]s 4000 NoBid |§ -
63 |STACKABLE VERTICAL PANEL w/ RUBBER BASE - 2 SIDED (LEFT) ORANGE/WHITE 28" height 10 3758 37500 ]S 4055|$ 40550 | NoBid |s - No Bid $ - NoBid | - s 40.00 40000 | 5 3800 [ § 38000 | NoBd [ 5
64 |STACKABLE VERTICAL PANEL w/ RUBBER BASE - 2 SIDED (RIGHT) ORANGE/WHITE 28" height 10 375]$ 37500|$  4055|$ 40550 | Nomid s - No Bid s s NoBid | s 40.00 40000 [ $ 3800 | s 38000 | NoBid [ 5
65 |RIGID PANEL OPPOSING LANE DIVIDER - 2 SIDED w/ RUBBER BASE 28" height 10 8595] 5 85050 16000 [$ 160000 NoBid |s No Bid $ - NoBid | s 13000 [$ 130000 [ s 15000 [$ 150000 | NoBid | -
66| TYPE | BARRICADE PLASTIC A-FRAME ORANGE / WHITE REFLECTIVE s RAIL1"x 8" 25 58.65] $ 1466.25 61856 154625 | NoBid |s No Bid $ - NoBid |s B 5500 [$ 137500 s 5500 S 1.37500| NoBid |$ -
67 |407 YETI SIGN STAND (PORTABLE) FOR TYPE Ill BARRICADE, BASE 30 $ - 83256 249750 | NoBid |s No Bid $ - NoBid |s B 5000 [$ 150000 | 5600 S 168000 | NoBid |§ -
68 |PLASTIC DRUM w/ RUBBER BASE ORANGE / WHITE REFLECTIVE 10 375]$ 37500 4725|$ 47250 | Nosid [s No Bid $ - NoBid |s B 3500 $ 35000 | 5 4500 s 45000 | NoBid |$ -
69 |TRAFFIC CONE TWO PIECE REFLECTIVE COLLAR 28" height 20 1499 $ 29980 1495 [$ 20000 NoBid |s No Bid $ - NoBid |s B 13008 26000 | 1600 | § 32000 | NoBid [ -
70 | TRAFFIC CONE TWO PIECE REFLECTIVE COLLAR 36" height 10 1895( $ 18950 17.75 8 17750 | NoBid |s No Bid $ - NoBid |s B 1499 8 14990 | s 1800 | $ 18000 | NoBd [ -
71 |TRAFFIC CONE TWO PIECE REFLECTIVE COLLAR 42" height 10 2835 28350 4055 |$ 40550 | Nosid [s No Bid $ - NoBid |s B 33008 33000 No Bid NoBid | -
72 [TYPE Il PLASTICADE BARRICADE Ol ITE HIP OR COMAL COUNTY APPROVED |24 x 48"
EQUIVALENT 20 34955 69900 |8 4672 |$ 93440 | NoBid |s No Bid $ - NoBid | - |s 4600 | $ 92000 | s 5500 [$ 110000 | NoBid |$ -
73| TYPE I BARRICADE FOR USE WITH # 40 YETI BASE G 20 NoBid [s - 22200 $ 444000 NoBid |s - No Bid $ - NoBid |s -~ |s 13000 [$ 260000 | s 13000 [$ 260000 | NoBid | -
74 |ROLLUP STOP/SLOW PADDLE W/ STAFF HIP 24" 20 5275 $ 105500 [ § 2068 [$ 50360 NoBd [s - No Bid $ - NoBid |s -~ s 89008 178000 s 8800 S 176000 | NoBid |$ -

TOTAL $17.012.45 $176.872.85 $41.696.10 $ 29.99350 s 75739.95 $  139.202.50 $  180.088.00 $ 13881564



